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One of the most significant barriers to advanced eye care is cost. Many effective treatments 
exist, but their high price points prevent patients from accessing them, particularly in rural 
and regional areas where the Barossa Eye Clinic serves as a primary resource. The Barossa 
Eye Clinic Training and Research Foundation is working to change this through innovative 
approaches to treatment delivery that maintain effectiveness while dramatically reducing 
costs. 

 

The Challenge of Treatment Accessibility 
 

Advanced eye care treatments often come with substantial costs that can exclude many 
patients who would benefit from them. This is particularly problematic for conditions like 
blepharitis, where effective treatments exist but remain financially out of reach for many 
patients. 

 

Traditional Lipiflow therapy, while highly effective for treating blepharitis and dry eye 
conditions, costs between $700-$1,500 per treatment and may need to be repeated every 
9-24 months to maintain relief [1]. For many patients, especially those in rural areas or on 
fixed incomes, these costs represent a significant barrier to accessing effective treatment. 

 

The UniSA Collaboration: Innovation Through Partnership 
 

The foundation's partnership with the University of South Australia (UniSA) exemplifies 
how academic-clinical collaborations can drive meaningful innovation that directly benefits 
patients. Together, they are developing a lid blepharitis device designed to deliver 
Lipiflow-style treatment at a fraction of the traditional cost. 

 

This collaboration leverages UniSA's engineering expertise and research capabilities while 
drawing on Dr de Wit's extensive clinical experience in treating ocular surface diseases and 



dry eye conditions. The combination of academic innovation and clinical insight is essential 
for developing solutions that are both technically sound and practically useful. 

 

Clinical Foundation for Innovation 
 

Dr de Wit's expertise in dry eye and ocular surface disease provides the clinical foundation 
necessary for this innovative work. His practice includes comprehensive assessment and 
treatment using "advanced internationally derived algorithms" and cutting-edge treatments 
including "Cacichol Mimetic from France, Amniotic membrane from New Zealand, 
Autologous blood locally" [2]. 

 

This international perspective and commitment to evidence-based treatment approaches 
ensure that the new device being developed will meet the highest clinical standards while 
addressing the practical challenges faced by patients and practitioners. 

 

Beyond Cost Reduction: Improving Access 
 

The goal of developing cost-effective treatment solutions extends beyond simply reducing 
prices. The foundation aims to create treatments that are not only affordable but also 
accessible to patients in diverse settings, from urban specialty clinics to rural general 
practices. 

 

This accessibility focus is particularly important in the Australian context, where vast 
distances can create significant barriers to accessing specialized medical care. By developing 
treatments that can be effectively delivered in various healthcare settings, the foundation is 
working to ensure that geographic location doesn't determine access to quality eye care. 

 

Maintaining Quality While Reducing Costs 
 

The challenge in developing cost-effective treatments is maintaining clinical effectiveness 
while reducing costs. The foundation's approach emphasizes rigorous testing and validation 
to ensure that cost reductions don't compromise treatment outcomes. 

 



Dr de Wit's extensive clinical experience provides the benchmark for evaluating new 
treatment approaches. Any cost-effective solution must demonstrate comparable outcomes 
to existing treatments while offering meaningful cost advantages to patients. 

 

The Broader Impact of Cost-Effective Innovation 
 

The development of cost-effective treatment solutions has implications that extend far 
beyond individual patient care. By making advanced treatments more accessible, the 
foundation is contributing to improved public health outcomes and reduced healthcare 
system costs. 

 

When patients can access effective treatments early in the disease process, it often prevents 
more serious complications that would require more expensive interventions later. This 
preventive approach benefits both patients and the broader healthcare system. 

 

Technology Transfer and Scalability 
 

The innovations being developed through the UniSA collaboration have the potential for 
broader application beyond the immediate clinical setting. Successful cost-effective 
treatment solutions can be scaled and adapted for use in other healthcare systems, 
multiplying their impact. 

 

The foundation's approach to innovation emphasizes practical implementation and 
scalability from the beginning of the development process. This ensures that successful 
innovations can be effectively transferred to other settings and benefit a broader patient 
population. 

 

Patient-Centered Design 
 

The development of cost-effective treatment solutions is guided by patient-centered design 
principles that prioritize ease of use, comfort, and effectiveness from the patient's 
perspective. This approach ensures that cost reductions don't come at the expense of patient 
experience or treatment outcomes. 



 

The foundation's clinical practice provides ongoing feedback about patient needs and 
preferences, informing the development process and ensuring that new solutions address 
real-world challenges faced by patients and practitioners. 

 

Research and Development Process 
 

The development of cost-effective treatment solutions involves rigorous research and 
development processes that include laboratory testing, clinical trials, and ongoing 
evaluation. The foundation's commitment to evidence-based practice ensures that new 
treatments meet the highest standards of safety and effectiveness. 

 

The collaboration with UniSA provides access to advanced research facilities and expertise 
that might not be available in a purely clinical setting. This academic partnership enhances 
the foundation's research capabilities while providing students and researchers with 
valuable real-world experience. 

 

Future Directions 
 

The success of the blepharitis device project could serve as a model for developing 
cost-effective solutions for other eye conditions. The foundation's approach to innovation, 
emphasizing collaboration, clinical validation, and patient-centered design, can be applied to 
address other barriers to eye care access. 

 

As the foundation's research capabilities continue to develop, there may be opportunities to 
tackle other high-cost treatments and develop more accessible alternatives that maintain 
clinical effectiveness while reducing financial barriers. 

 

Community Impact 
 

The development of cost-effective treatment solutions directly benefits the communities 
served by the Barossa Eye Clinic and has the potential to improve eye care access 
throughout South Australia and beyond. By making advanced treatments more affordable, 



the foundation is working to ensure that quality eye care is available to all patients, 
regardless of their financial circumstances. 

 

This community focus reflects the foundation's charitable mission and commitment to 
improving eye care accessibility for all patients. The impact of these innovations extends far 
beyond individual treatments to contribute to broader improvements in community health 
and wellbeing. 
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*To learn more about cost-effective treatment options at the Barossa Eye Clinic, contact the 
clinic at 08 8520 6107.* 
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